
Gorakhpur, 

Varanasi to be 

textile hubs 
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L\tclmow: The state govern­
ment will set up an apparel 
park and textile hub In Go­
rakbpur, Varanasi and Agra 
to promote readymade gar­
ment sector In thestate. 

The government w1ll g1ve 
substd1es on land purchase to 
attract buyers. Thts w1ll ensu­
re that project cost remalnS 
lO\Vand tndustr1al istsareable 
to setupunits easily. The deci­
sion was taken by additional 
cb1ef secretary (MSME) Nav­
neet Sehgal on Wednesday. 

"For the development of 
t.extlle and apparel industry, 
the government had lnvttecl 
'requests for proposal' . Three 
companies had presented 
RFPs,,. Sehgalsaid. 

Hesaldonetextileparkeach 
wouldbesetup lnpriorityareas 
andaddedthata scheme bad be­
en prepared tosetup tntegratOO 
textlle parks by handloom and 
textlle Industry In oollabora­
tton wltb private sectoI These 
textlle parks w1ll be developed 
and operated by prtvate develo­
pers. In Gorakhpm; readymade 
garments bave been named the 
second product after terraootta 
underODOPscheme. 


