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i. Set-aside the orders dated 19.03.2018 and 24.1 1L.2017 passed by Managing Director. UPSIDC and the 
consequential order dated 28.03.2018 passed by Regional Manager. UPSIDC. 

ii. Issue a No objection Certificate to be issued by the UPSIDC for creation of an equitable mortgage of 
the property of applicant in favour of M/s Kotak Mahindra Bank during the subsistence of lease period. 

iii. Refund Rs. 37,82,40 1/- along with interest to the applicant while holding that no impact charges for 
additional FAR from I.5 to 2.I5 is payable by the applicant to the UPSIDC. 

iv. Initiate disciplinary proceeding against the present MD, UPSIDC for misconduct committed for 
concealing the minutes of meeting of UPSIDA Board dated 28.08.2003 in his order dated 24.11.2017 



"ln View of the peculiar facts and circumstances of this case, learned, Senior counsel appearing for the 

respondent, submits that if the Petitioners make a representation to respondent no.5 Utar Pradesh State 
Industrial Development Authority (UPSIDA) for appropriate relief. their representation shall be 
considered and decided in merits in accordance with law, within time frame. Counsel for the petitioners 
submits that petitioners are prepared to make representation for appropriate relief and directions may be 
issued to decide the same after giving them an opportunity of being heard. In the circumstances, we 
dispose of this petition by following order: 

Petitioners shall make a representation to the Chairman UPSIDA within a period of four weeks from 
today. If such a representation is made the Chairman, UPSIDA shall consider and decide the same after 
granting an opportunity of being heard to the petitioners as expeditiously as possible and preferably 
within a period of two weeks there from. In view thereof the orders dated 19.03.2018, 24.1 1.2017 and the 
consequential order dated 28.03.2018 shall remain in abeyance. 

At this stage we also place on record that the posts of Managing Director of Uttar Pradesh State Industrial 
Development Corporation (UPSIDC) and of Chief Executive Officer of UPSIDA are held by one and the 
same officer and therefore, we have allowed the petitioners to make representation to the Chairman of 
UPSIDA." 

3.2 MTAtT Haty feaies 25.05.2006 4T qug HsI-f-8, HIGT-4 À fhe-ted hAÌteH 



30.07.2007 t fahT JTTI 

UA àR HUgG f ic5 27. 12.2002 3161 243t docF fe Jjr fauUqHR 

fceiics 27.07.2006 fuTH AàYrcs HUSI taics 03.06.2006 ast HF4G 253� to 

HSYT-1418 fcicF 05 09 200i ATLTH 30�o 3taifucs T faH HÍOAH 1976 rf 

faftuHa 2004 TAT Ha fafruaa 2004 ¿aics 29.04.2005 nt ar frt TT a 3HqHT{ 



3TRT HsyT- 4653-59 fic5 15.02.2003 sfefad yfI ufuda Hq-tft fe-R 

6- UH GRI IT Hts HT HT 4653-59 fics 15.02.2003 3ToGul tct 

q feUH gRI YE HSYT-Camp/ VH31T$S00T / ATP/Surajpur, C-4, Dated 19.11.2008 ATH H 
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"Counsel for UPSIDC on instruction, submit that the UPSIDC shall consider and decide the petitioners' 
request made vide application dated 12.05.2017 (Annexure) and reminders dated 19.07.2017 and 

10.08.2017 as expeditiously as possible and preferably within a period of three weeks from today. His 
statement is recorded and accepted. In view thereof, nothing further survives in the petition. Petition is 

accordingly deposed of. It is needless to mention that the UPSIDC shall communicate their decision 
within a period of one week to the petitioners from the date of the decision." 

12- ATO 3d TTY, ScIEIIG ERI RT ihI HO-37696/2017 À fica 22.08.2017 T 

(H) Hqug HEUI-&-8, HI`E-4 TadT o faceRT afUtfeciGi yrofeo GRI 34tHlGAR 

13- 34th à hH À ya ARrG qÝvHIS`TÍT feo a 3946 falcH 19:03 2018 gRT 
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ettu yaUS, H{IYr GHI UI HTAI 10379 aics 28.03.20 18 HTTA yug HGAI &0-8. 

HI 6850-52 ar5 23.11.2006, 4aA HTafdT F0pt 3HIRT / HGI 9439-41 feaici 

qHHIZ`TÍ0-36r-qrfe feics 15.02.2003 GIRT IT faRT-Aet (aGsel_H) HR HUg 
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